

BID TABULATION SHEET

Bid Date: May 18, 2022, Bid Time: 2:00 p.m.

Bid Location: Perry Farm Farmhouse, 459 N. Kennedy Dr., Bourbonnais, IL 60914

Bright Architecture, Inc. 200 E. Court St., Suite 700

Kankakee, IL 60901

Project No: Project: Roof Replacement At Perry Farm & Recreation Station

Base Bid 1 - BASE BID (to include all base bid work as shown on drawings) (\$10,000.00 Contingency included in Base Bid)

CONTRACTOR	SEOS	+655	BASEAID	ALT. R.A	Price 1 Sq. Ft.	Unda Phone 2 Lin. Fil.	Unit Price 3 Lin. Pt	State of the state	REMARKS
GME PLLC	႙		171,206.65	67,336.57	2.97	12.00	9.50	×	
J.F. Chiattello			NO BID						
Langlois Roofing	5%	×	297,475.00	139,460.00	5.75	9.50	4.50	×	Standard Color
MMRM - Metalmaster			NO BID						
Seal Tite	5%	×	301,000.00	102,200.00	5.50	12.00	8.00	×	Standard Color
Sentry			NO BID						
Top Roofing			NO BID						

Alternate G-1: ADD - All work at Recreation Station

Unit Price - 1 - Replace deteriorated solid sheathing with 5/8" CDX plywood.

Unit Price - 2 - Replace deteriorated facia or soffit boards with treated 1 x boards (painted to match).

Unit Price – 3 – Furnish/Install new 1x treated deck boards at locations required for fastening of synthetic shake where a gap may occur in the existing deck boards.